
2024-74 | FORD PUMA
1.0T EcoBoost MHEV ST-Line X DCT Euro 6 (s/s) 5dr,

ONLY 98 Miles | Hybrid | Automatic | Cactus Grey

https://www.pwmillar.co.uk

01446 733248

£23,990
From £425 per month PCP

Mileage 97 miles

Fuel Hybrid

Engine 1 litre

Transmission Automatic

Gears 7

Insurance
group 13E

SPECIFICATIONS

Child safety lock Power assist steering
Automatic headlights with rain
sensing wipers and auto high
beam

3 seat bench in 2nd row
Comfort pack with power lift
tailgate - Puma Sport suspension

Thatcham alarm
Ford pass connect and
emergency assistance

18" Absolute black machined
finish alloy wheel

Tyre pressure monitoring
system (TPMS)

Full digital 12.8" instrument
cluster

LED rear lamps

Electronic automatic
temperature control (EATC)

12" landscape touchscreen
display with wireless apple car
play and android auto premium
B&O audio system with 10
speakers

Tyre inflation kit

Pre-collision assist with
autonomous emergency
braking, pedestrian/cyclist
detection & post-collision
braking

Lane keeping aid with lane
departure warning

Large body colour rear roof
spoiler

ST-Line X Premium synthetic
leather upholstery

Ford SYNC4 with connected
navigation

Electronic stability control (ESC)
and hill start assist

Selectable drive modes(Normal,
sport, Eco, trail, slippery) LED daytime running lights

Ford megabox extended
bootspace

3 rear seatbelts
Cruise control with Intelligent
speed assist

Power foldable heated door
mirrors with puddle lamps and
puma logo protection

Front and rear head restraints Emergency call service LED third brake light

Manual 4 way driver seat adjust
with lumbar adjustment

Ford easy fuel ST-Line X body styling kit

Centre console with armrest and
stowage Driver impairment monitor Solid paint

TECHNICAL

Performance

0-100 kmh

(62 mph)
9.6 s

Top speed 118 mph

Power 125 bhp

Torque 210 Nm

Fuel Consumption Ice

MPG

(combined)
49.6 mpg

L/100km

(combined)
5.7 l/100km

Vehicle Dimensions

Length 4186 mm

Width 1805 mm

Height 1550 mm

Capacities

Seats 5

Boot

(seats up)
456 litres

Boot

(seats down)
1216 litres

Fuel tank 42 litres

General

Trim ST-Line X

Power (PS) 125

NCAP Overall 4

....MORE.... For the full details please call us or scan the QR code above

01446 733248

sales@pwmillar.co.uk

P W Millar 148 Port Road East Barry South Glamorgan CF62 9PZ

Whilst every effort has been made to ensure the accuracy of the vehicle specification, some inaccuracies may occasionally occur. It is

important that you do not rely solely on this information, but check with a member of the sales staff about any features which may affect

your decision to buy the car.


